
 
 

DCN Wireless Project for Holiday Inn Baruna 
Resort Bali - Indonesia 

Industry: 
Lodging, Hotels 

End User:  
Hoilday Inn Resort Baruna Bali  
The Holiday Inn Resort Baruna Bali  was built in a traditional 
Balinese style to compliment its beachfront setting. Apart from 
the construction of an events room equipped with an excellent 
conference system, the resort also has a banquet hall and 5 
meeting rooms that can accommodate up to 350 people.  The 
total project was completed in February 2009. 

Business Objective: 
The Holiday Inn Resort Baruna Bali requires a state-of-the-art 
conference system for their banquet hall and meeting rooms. 
 
 
 
 
 Solution: 

As advised by the experienced Smart Technic and PT. Multi 
Sistem Komunikasi, Bosch Security Systems' System Integrator 
partners, the Bosch Digital Congress Network (DCN) wireless 
was installed at the resort. Also, the DCN wireless was able to 
suit the preference of Holiday Inn Resort Baruna Bali to have 
stand-alone integrated systems for conference room set-ups.  
 
The wireless discussion unit is designed for all kinds of 
gatherings and meetings. In addition, it offers a high level of 
functionality, digital convenience, and distinctive styling. The 
DCN wireless system is easy to install, and can be re-arranged 
and operated with virtually no impact on the integrity of the 
location. 
 
Holiday Inn Resort Baruna Bali has full trust in using the Bosch 
conference system. A total of 6 units of DCN-WCCU, DCN-WAP, 
LBB 1259, 6 units of DCN-WD-D Chairman, 36 units of DCN-
WD-D Delegate, and 6 units of DCN-WCH05 are installed in the 
DCN wireless system. 
 
Due to the flexible design of Bosch DCN wireless system, the 
banquet hall and meeting rooms at Holiday Inn Resort Baruna 
Bali can be set up for conferences and seminars with a great 
degree of freedom. 

Result: 

With Bosch's DCN wireless system in place, the Holiday Inn 
Resort Baruna Bali enjoys an extremely flexible conference 
solution and a high mobilization of clear communication. 
 
The Building Manager of Holiday Inn Resort Baruna Bali has 
complete confidence in the system, explaining that "the 
comprehensive solution from Bosch ensures that we are able 
to communicate clearly". 
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